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COURSE CODE COURSE DESCRIPTION 

AVC 5200 – 
Museums and 
Galleries of 

London 

Considers the nature of museums and art galleries and their 
role and function in our society and culture. Students study the 
workings of the art market and a variety of other topics that 
impinge upon it, such as conservation, restoration, the 
investment potential of art, and art world crime. Students visit 
many of the great London galleries and museums with their rich 
intercultural collections, as part of this course. A university-
level survey of the history of international art is strongly 
recommended as a prerequisite. 

FLM 4200 – 
Intro to Film 

Studies 

This course explores film as a medium across cultural and 
historical contexts. It covers films in its varied form, from the 
first projections in the late 19th century to online distribution 
today. Using examples of noteworthy films, it takes an 
introductory examination of the most important film theories 
and concepts, in the process examining how ideologies and 
meanings are imbedded in this vibrant medium. 

HST 4405 – 
History of 
Fashion 

This course analyses the history of fashion from a sociological 
perspective – covering the period from the beginning of the 
modern period to the present. Relationships between dress, 
fashion, class, political power, ethnicity and gender are 
investigated. While the primary focus is upon the historical 
development of western fashion global interconnections are 
investigated throughout the course. 

LIT 5405 – 
British Fantasy 

Writing 

This course will explore the vibrant genre tradition of fantastic 
and non-realist writing using a range of critical approaches. The 
first half of the course will survey some of the major texts on 
which modern Fantasy literature draws, including Beowulf, 
Arthurian texts and selections from works by Shakespeare, 
Milton, Jane Austen and Lewis Carroll. The second half of the 
course will focus more intensively on a few major fantasies 
from the past 120 years and their filmed adaptations, including 
works by Bram Stoker, J.R.R. Tolkien, and J.K. Rowling, and will 
look at how these texts and their filmic counterparts repurpose 
and revision older ideas for novel purposes. 

MKT 5410 – 
Psychology of 
Fashion and 

Luxury Goods 

Consumer psychology within the context of the consumption of 
fashion and luxury products and services is complex and is 
influenced by many factors. A thorough analysis and 
understanding of these factors allows organizations to plan 
effective marketing activities suitable to their target markets. 
This course enables students to understand the importance of 
consumer behaviour in the process of marketing fashion and 
luxury goods and services. 



PLT 5205 – 
British Politics: 

Inside 
Parliament 

This course will introduce students to the main political 
institutions in the United Kingdom (the monarchy, the 
executive, parliament, political parties and electoral systems) 
and to important debates in contemporary British society, such 
as constitutional reform, Britain’s relations with Europe, the 
power of the media, gender debates and multiculturalism. The 
class combines theoretical and empirical approaches. Classes 
are supplemented by 10 sessions in the House of Commons with 
a Member of Parliament. 

 
 
 


